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The paper presents graphical and formal possibilities of moiré patterns 
in architecture in different contexts. The paper distinguishes between 
randomly generated and designer’s controlled (influenced) moiré 
patterns. Some mathematical methods can predict, under certain 
limitations, the geometric properties of moiré. Those 2D Fourier 
transformation-based methods would not be considered in the paper, 
but the basic notions, could be taken from strict mathematical theory of 
the moiré phenomenon. A short, straightforward, vector-based 
explanation is given at this point. 

In the first group of patterns paper presents carefully selected cases of 
moiré generated by various periodic and not periodic gratings, grids 
and dot patterns using the examples from recently completed buildings. 
Stiff, rigid superposed layers like screen-printed glass, or perforated 
metal sheets do produce predictable results in a greater extent, while 
the soft, distortable layers, like fabrics, canvases, loose meshes 
generate the shapes that are almost impossible to estimate. A link 
between the images of component superposed layers, their frequency, 
and superposition angle with the resulting moiré pattern is researched 
here.

In the second group of patterns paper shows the cases where the 
designer, by the proper arrangement of component image layers, can 
consciously influence the result of generated moiré pattern. Two basic 
techniques are described at this point: moiré fringe multiplication, and 
moiré magnification. The former allows to control the moiré frequency, 
by regulating the frequency of component layers (e.g. obtained moiré 
pattern is doubled with the doubling of the reference gratings, dot-
screens etc.). The latter describes a special case of the (1,0,-1,0) moiré 
type, that shows striking phenomenon of blur and magnification of dots 
of any given shape lying on layer A, by superposition of layer B with tiny 
pinholes of identical period at a small angle of difference. The moiré 
image is showed by sampling any-shape dots of layer A, through a 
holes in layer B. The results could be obtained by superposing white 
and black dot-screens as well, but the moiré pattern generated depend 
on the color and could be produced in inverse video.  
In addition, this chapter describes a method of obtaining visually 
appealing moving images (up to 7 frames) by the usage of properly 
designed component layers A and B. This could be used to obtain the 
illusion of movement on the facades that do not contain any real 
movable parts, but are observed in motion (e.g. from passing car, train 
etc.). The ease of application allows this phenomenon to be used both 
in public and commercial buildings. A selection of author’s designed 
exemplary façade’s patterns is presented in the paper.
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